



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**^{sc}
LAW FIRM

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP
C/O WCG - STEERING COMMITTEE
DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.
2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600
MADISON, WI 53703

Date: September 14, 2011
Invoice: 919414
Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY

To Professional Services

		Rate	Hours	Amount
	John Duncan Varda			
07-16-11	NO CHARGE - Review log study, prepare for conference call with Pasi Lautala	0	1.50	0.00
08-05-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference with T. Klimek regarding E&LS car rebuilding, T. Tisa contacts, log business, scheduling meeting	0	0.40	0.00
08-05-11	NO CHARGE - At Park Falls, discussion with W. Johnson and B. Johnson, Jr. regarding Steering Committee, project status (time prorated)	0	0.45	0.00
08-06-11	NO CHARGE - Review T. Tisa email and memo follow-up to July 12, 2011 letter to V. Kachroo; memo to Steering Committee regarding same; forward to Johnsons, Burkhardt and Schauer	0	1.70	0.00
08-07-11	NO CHARGE - Follow-up note from Flambeau River from W. Johnson	0	0.10	0.00
08-08-11	NO CHARGE - Preparatory notes; telephone conference with T. Klimek, E&LS and notes	0	0.70	0.00
08-08-11	NO CHARGE - Draft reply memo to T. Tisa; circulate same	0	0.50	0.00
08-09-11	NO CHARGE - Note to B. Ridley regarding Senator Johnson meeting at Madison, follow-up meeting, warehouse-distribution south of Chicago; further response to T. Tisa	0	0.35	0.00
08-10-11	NO CHARGE - Note from K. Hager regarding Fox Valley Chamber	0	0.15	0.00
08-15-11	At Green Bay, extended conference with T. Klimek, Escanaba & Lake Superior Railroad	385	2.00	770.00
08-17-11	NO CHARGE - Review notes regarding CN potential spin-off activity	0	0.20	0.00
08-17-11	NO CHARGE - Extended discussion with Tom Ciske, Fox Cities Chamber of Commerce; assemble and forward Stakeholder Network information; note to J. Landin and J. Culotta regarding same	0	0.75	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: September 14, 2011
Invoice: 919414
Client: 71729.000
Page: 2

Capitol Square Office
Two East Mifflin Street
Suite 600
Madison, WI 53703-2865
FAX 608-252-9243
TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
08-18-11	NO CHARGE - Prepare draft agenda for Steering committee; at DeWitt, meet with B. Ridley and Senator Johnson event and deliver draft agenda and spin-off consulting proposal	0	1.50	0.00
08-18-11	NO CHARGE - Review attendee list, Chairman Elliott visit to Tomahawk; instructions to assistant and further regarding website update process	0	0.40	0.00
08-19-11	NO CHARGE - Discussion with M. Olson regarding website layout	0	0.40	0.00
08-19-11	NO CHARGE - Edit and forward Steering Committee agenda; attention to Steering Committee participation invitations, research shipper websites and background; exchanges with assistant regarding contacts updates	0	2.50	0.00
08-20-11	NO CHARGE - Research regarding timber resources, production, Wisconsin and Upper Michigan	0	1.20	0.00
08-22-11	NO CHARGE - Instructions and questions regarding modifying WCGroup website pages; further regarding updating Stakeholder Network; deal with responses to Steering Committee invitation, Plum Creek, Weathershield, Longyear; send second request	0	0.60	0.00
08-22-11	NO CHARGE - Forward memo "Rail Cars for Timber Recovery" to B. Hagerty and Governor's office, E. Schoenfeldt, T. Tisa at Canadian National; circulate same to interested stakeholders; follow-up exchanges with B. Hagerty	0	1.30	0.00
08-22-11	NO CHARGE - Draft further letter to V. Kachroo regarding the three "Projects"	0	1.30	0.00
08-23-11	NO CHARGE - Review comments from B. Ridley; edit draft letter to V. Kachroo	0	1.10	0.00
08-23-11	NO CHARGE - Further on invitations to participate in Steering Committee	0	0.50	0.00
08-24-11	NO CHARGE - Forward updated draft of Kachroo letter to B. Ridley for comment; further attention to invitations to participate in the Steering Committee; contacts regarding funding; markup instructions for website update	0	1.40	0.00



Date: September 14, 2011
 Invoice: 919414
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 3

Capitol Square Office
 Two East Mifflin Street
 Suite 600
 Madison, WI 53703-2865
 FAX 608-252-9243
 TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
08-24-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference and follow-up with M. Robbins regarding car purchase agreement; email exchange with C. Timm regarding Steering Committee membership; process requests to participate in Steering Committee; review updated Stakeholder Updates page on website; research shipper information; research CN station and maps; review report on state of emergency declaration northwest WI downed timber; work on agenda update for August 30th Steering Committee conference call; Steering Committee Quick Update regarding additional participant at Steering Committee	0	2.50	0.00
08-25-11	NO CHARGE - Update Steering Committee conference call email, edit Kachroo letter and forward with updated agenda; further regarding new participant invitations	0	1.70	0.00
08-26-11	NO CHARGE - Instructions regarding updating email lists and scheduling next Stakeholder Update	0	0.20	0.00
08-26-11	NO CHARGE - Further shipper research; draft competition problem example regarding Green Bay Packaging, and begin draft regarding Wolf River Lumber; follow-up regarding downed timber with Johnson Timber, B. Ridley, T. Tisa and K. Korpi	0	2.90	0.00
08-27-11	NO CHARGE - Draft competition problem example letter to T. Tisa, Wolf River Lumber; draft cover letters to Green Bay Packaging and Wolf River Lumber; forward Steering Committee Quick update regarding same	0	2.20	0.00
08-28-11	NO CHARGE - Complete competition problem example letter to T. Tisa regarding Wolf River and Schmit Trucking	0	2.10	0.00
08-29-11	NO CHARGE - Connect with t. Henderson, Biewer Lumber, regarding participation in Steering committee; review note from M. Graceffa	0	0.40	0.00
08-29-11	NO CHARGE - Assemble correspondence regarding competition problems, case studies; draft Stakeholder Network Update No. 3; printouts for Steering Committee meeting; review exchanges regarding governor's Freight Summit (search regarding same), potential invitation; quick update to Steering committee	0	2.50	0.00
08-30-11	NO CHARGE - Preparation for conference call , exchanges with M. Graceffa and J. Hayrynen regarding follow-up briefings; travel to WMC for conference call	0	1.80	0.00
08-30-11	Steering Committee conference call	385	1.00	385.00
08-30-11	Assemble and forward Kachroo and Tisa letters; quick updates to Steering Committee; follow-up letters to the case study shippers; advice to B. Ridley on further thoughts about spin-off/dismemberment position; further edits to Stakeholder Update No. 3	0	2.25	0.00



**DEWITT
ROSS & STEVENS**
LAW FIRM

Date: September 14, 2011
 Invoice: 919414
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 4

Capitol Square Office
 Two East Mifflin Street
 Suite 600
 Madison, WI 53703-2865
 FAX 608-252-9243
 TEL 608-255-8891

John Duncan Varda				
08-30-11	Multiple email exchanges with T. Tisa, Canadian National regarding three competition problems, Green Bay Packaging, Wolf River and Schmit Trucking	0	1.20	0.00
08-31-11	NO CHARGE - Work on response to Canadian National position on dealing with competition problem examples; attempt to formulate position (time prorated)	0	1.80	0.00
08-31-11	Finalize letter to T. Tisa regarding Advisory Board, shifting perspectives; telephone conference with B. Ridley regarding same; forward correspondence to T. Tisa and follow-up round of email exchange (time prorated)	0	1.80	0.00
08-31-11	NO CHARGE - Advice to B. Ridley regarding Advisory Board membership	0	0.25	0.00

Total Current Professional Services	25	45.60	1,155.00
-------------------------------------	----	-------	----------

Total Current Services and Disbursements	1,155.00
Balance Outstanding on this Matter as of 09-14-11	5,054.25
TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT	6,209.25
RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY	

Trust Account Activity for this Invoice

Trust Account Balance as of 09-14-11	10,000.00
Application of Trust to Balance Due on Account	0.00
Balance Remaining in Trust as of 09-14-11	10,000.00